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Comenius : Exchange in France 

A trip to Annecy 

Climate changes because
 of Global warming 

in all Europe! p.4

Pensions in France 
between shocking 

and admiring...p.30-32
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On 7th of December in 
Lycee du Granier in 
Chambéry Comenius
programme took place, 
students with their 
teachers from 6 countries,
Poland,Spain, France, 
Cyprus, Portugal and 
Germany were here to 
participate
in the programme 
comenius.The programme 
lasted 5 days and the 
students have 
been hosted by french 
families during this time 
pupils realized loads of 
activities and they spoke 
about 
economical and political 
problems and mainly for 
political identity. Also 
students went to trips,
 out with friends and spent 
nice time.
They made friendships 
with all countries. See you 
in May when the next 
meeting will take place in 
Cyprus!
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